
BID TABULATION-BID SUBMISSION
ITB 3-25 "ASPHALT (HOT/COLD) PLANT BASED LOCATIONS"
ERICKA ANDREW, PRINCIPAL BUYER
EMAIL: ANDREWE@JCCAL.ORG
PHONE: (205)325-8707

ITEM # ALDOT SPEC BOOK REF # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE BY

1 COLD MIX PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS BASE, MIX 1 TON $90.00 $100.00

2 COLD MIX PERMABLE ASPHALT TREATED BASE TON NO BID $100.00

1 327 A 020 PLANT MIX BITUMINOUS BASE, MIX 1 TON $62.24 $59.75

2 327 E 000 PERMABLE ASPHALT TREATED BASE TON $66.28 $59.75

3 430 B 019 NUMBER 78 BLAST FURNACE SLAG (Washed) TON NO BID NO BID

4 430 B 006 NUMBER 89 STONE TON NO BID NO BID

5 402 A 000 SLURRY DEAL COAT TYPE 1 & TYPE 2 TON NO BID NO BID

6 407 A 000
JOINT SEALANT – CRAFCO PAVEMENT JOINT ADHESIVE PART NO. 

34524
TON NO BID NO BID

7 420 A 015 POLYMER MODIFIED OPEN PATB GRADED FRICTION COURSE TON $114.67 $105.00

8 424 A 280 SUPERPAVE ½” E LEVEL WEARING SURFACE TON $79.64 $72.99

9 424 A 281 SUPERPAVE ¾” E LEVEL WEARING SURFACE TON $77.93 $69.99

10 424 A 336 SUPERPAVE 3/8” A/B LEVEL BASE & WEARING SURFACE TON $71.46 $68.99

11 424 A 340 SUPERPAVE ½” A/B LEVEL BASE & WEARING SURFACE TON $67.81 $67.99

12 424 A 341 SUPERPAVE ¾” A/B LEVEL BASE & WEARING SURFACE TON $63.40 $65.25

13 424 A 356 SUPERPAVE 3/8” C/D LEVEL BASE & WEARING SURFACE TON $71.64 $68.99

14 424 A 360 SUPERPAVE ½” C/D LEVEL BASE & WEARING SURFACE TON $67.81 $67.99

15 424 A 336 SUPERPAVE ¾” C/D LEVEL BASE & WEARING SURFACE TON $63.40 $65.25

16 424 C 340

SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE BASE

LAYER, 1” MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE

MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B

TON $62.24 $59.75

Price 

ASPHALT – COLD MIX

ASPHALT – HOT MIX

Price 

APAC - 
ALABAMA

DUNN 
CONSTRUCTION


